
Ms. Rósbjörg Jónsdóttir is the managing director of the Iceland Renewable 
Energy Cluster (IREC) since April 2022, the cluster organization serving the 
whole energy sector in Iceland (2013), where the focus is on increasing 
competitiveness of the Icelandic energy sector through innovation and 
knowledge sharing. Along with her MD position, Rósbjörg serves as the local 
partner for Social Progress Imperative in Iceland, emphasizing social progress 
within its society. Rósbjörg holds a BA in German and international business 
from the University of Iceland and an MBA from the same school in 2002. 2014 
Rósbjörg took an executive program in creating shared value at the HBS. 
Rósbjörg has years of experience in managing and creating all kinds of 
seminars, summits, and conferences, both locally and internationally. 
Specialized in bringing key players together from different industries and sectors 
and with different knowledge, with the aim to increase shared value. Rósbjörg 
mapped up, implemented, and founded the Iceland Tourism Cluster 2012-2016.  
 

 
Mr. Hans Bolscher is Secretary General of Geothermie Nederland, the Dutch 
industry association for geothermal energy. He is a Dutch economist and senior 
consultant. He formerly worked as director for Climate and Industry at the Dutch 
Ministry of the Environment and was Director CCS at the Ministry of Economic 
Affairs. Hans Bolscher currently serves as a board member and chair for several 
profit and non-profit organizations in the areas of climate, climate finance, and 
renewable energy. He is deeply involved in discussions around energy 
transition, climate finance and sustainable energy. 
 

 
Mr. Sigurður Atli Jónsson is CEO of Arctic Green Energy, who he joined as 
Vice Chairman and Senior Advisor in 2017 and has served as CEO from 2022. 
From 2011 to 2017 he was the chief executive officer of Kvika, an investment 
bank based in Iceland. A co-founder of ALFA Securities, he served as its chief 
executive officer from 2004 untill 2011. Before that, he was chief executive 
officer of Landsbréf and managing director and head of capital management at 
Landsbanki Íslands. He began his financial markets career at Landsbréf in 1994, 
after having worked at the National Economics Institute in Iceland. Mr Jónson 
holds an MA in economics from Queen's University in Canada and a BSc in 
economics from the University of Iceland. 
 

 
Mr. Antoine Lochet is a Counsel at BBA//Fjeldco, an Icelandic law firm with 
operations in Iceland, the UK and France. He is admitted to the Icelandic and 
French bars and specializes in corporate, project finance and energy 
law. Antoine Lochet has 15 years of international experience with a focus on 
energy regulations. He has provided advice to various international projects 
focusing on the analysis of legal and regulatory frameworks relating 
to geothermal resources and the drafting of legislation and regulations on 
geothermal energy. 


